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No other Reconstruction state government was as chaotic or violent as Louisiana's, located in New Orleans,
the largest southern city at the time. James K. Hogue explains the unique confluence of demographics,
geography, and wartime events that made New Orleans an epicenter in the upheaval of Reconstruction
politics and a critical battleground in the struggle for the future of southern society. No other Reconstruction
state government was as chaotic or violent as Louisiana's, located in New Orleans, the largest southern city
at the time. James K. Hogue explains the unique confluence of demographics, geography, and wartime
events that made New Orleans an epicenter in the upheaval of Reconstruction politics and a critical
battleground in the struggle for the future of southern society.

Hogue characterizes Reconstruction in Louisiana as a continuation of civil war, waged between well-
organized and well-armed forces vying to control the state's government. He details five key New Orleans
street battles, in which elite Confederate veterans played central roles, and gives an in-depth account of how
the Republican state government raised militias and a state police force to defend against the violence. In
response, a white supremacist movement arose in the mid-1870s and finally overthrew the Republicans. The
occupation of Louisiana by federal troops from 1862 to 1877 was the longest of its kind in American history.
Not coincidentally, Hogue argues, one of the longest unbroken periods of one-race, one-party dominance in
American history followed, lasting until 1972.

Uncivil War reveals that the long-term military impact of the South's occupation included twenty-five years
of crippled War Department budgets inflicted by southern congressmen who feared another Reconstruction.
Within Louisiana, the biracial Republican militias were dismantled, leaving blacks largely unarmed against
future atrocities; at the same time, the nucleus of the state's White Leagues became the Louisiana National
Guard, which defended the "Redeemer" government's repressive labor policies. White supremacist victory
cast its shadow over American race relations for almost a century.

Moving between national, state, and local realms, Uncivil War demystifies the interplay of force and politics
during a complex period of American history.
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From reader reviews:

Henry Barba:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading
behavior give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the actual
information inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on
what kind of reserve you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with education and learning books
but if you want feel happy read one with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual
Uncivil War: Five New Orleans Street Battles and the Rise and Fall of Radical Reconstruction is kind of
book which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Patricia Stroud:

This Uncivil War: Five New Orleans Street Battles and the Rise and Fall of Radical Reconstruction are
reliable for you who want to be described as a successful person, why. The explanation of this Uncivil War:
Five New Orleans Street Battles and the Rise and Fall of Radical Reconstruction can be one of the great
books you must have is giving you more than just simple studying food but feed you actually with
information that might be will shock your earlier knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it
almost everywhere and whenever your conditions in e-book and printed versions. Beside that this Uncivil
War: Five New Orleans Street Battles and the Rise and Fall of Radical Reconstruction forcing you to have an
enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that could it useful
in your day activity. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Sophie Clark:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new details.
When you read a book you will get new information since book is one of a number of ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, looking at a book will make an individual more imaginative. When
you reading through a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to definitely imagine
the story how the character types do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other individuals.
When you read this Uncivil War: Five New Orleans Street Battles and the Rise and Fall of Radical
Reconstruction, it is possible to tells your family, friends and also soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge
can inspire different ones, make them reading a publication.

Jesus Moreno:

Reading can called thoughts hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book specially book
entitled Uncivil War: Five New Orleans Street Battles and the Rise and Fall of Radical Reconstruction your
thoughts will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe not known for but
surely will become your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a reserve then become one form



conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get ahead of. The Uncivil War: Five New Orleans Street
Battles and the Rise and Fall of Radical Reconstruction giving you an additional experience more than blown
away your mind but also giving you useful facts for your better life with this era. So now let us teach you the
relaxing pattern this is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished examining it, like
winning a. Do you want to try this extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?
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