
The Power of Feelings: Personal Meaning in
Psychoanalysis, Gender, and Culture

Nancy J. Chodorow

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0300089090
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0300089090
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=0300089090


The Power of Feelings: Personal Meaning in Psychoanalysis,
Gender, and Culture

Nancy J. Chodorow

The Power of Feelings: Personal Meaning in Psychoanalysis, Gender, and Culture Nancy J. Chodorow
In the middle of the twentieth century, leading cultural critics and visionaries-Erik Erikson, Lionel Trilling,
Herbert Marcuse, and many others-turned to psychoanalysis as a measure of human personal and cultural
fulfillment. Now, as we enter a new millennium, Nancy J. Chodorow, well known as a feminist theorist and
psychoanalyst, takes her place in this line of eminent thinkers and revitalizes their project. Psychoanalysis,
she claims, offers in its clinical goals and its vision of possibility insight into the nature of subjectivity and
the quality of good relations with others. It continues centuries of reflection and imagination about the good
life. In this pathbreaking book, Chodorow draws upon her broad knowledge and background in social theory,
her feminism, and her experience as a psychoanalyst. In extensively elaborated chapters on psychoanalytic
theory, she argues that a psychoanalysis that takes as its starting point the immediacy of unconscious fantasy
and feeling found in the clinical encounter can illuminate our understanding of individual subjectivity and
potentially transform all sociocultural thought. Creating a dialogue between feminism, anthropology, and
psychoanalysis, she holds that feminism, anthropology, and other cultural theories require that
psychoanalysts take seriously how cultural meanings help to constitute psychic life. At the same time,
psychoanalysis demonstrates that contemporary theories of meaning cannot neglect the unconscious realm,
which has just as much power as culture does to create meaning for the individual. Chodorow acknowledges
postmodern accounts of the decentering and fragmentation of individuality but argues that psychoanalysis
gives us an account of subjectivity that incorporates forms of wholeness and depth of experience, without
which we cannot have a meaningful life.
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From reader reviews:

Charles English:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. To
be sure that book is very important usually. The book The Power of Feelings: Personal Meaning in
Psychoanalysis, Gender, and Culture seemed to be making you to know about other information and of
course you can take more information. It doesn't matter what advantages for you. The e-book The Power of
Feelings: Personal Meaning in Psychoanalysis, Gender, and Culture is not only giving you much more new
information but also to get your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your own spend time to read
your e-book. Try to make relationship while using book The Power of Feelings: Personal Meaning in
Psychoanalysis, Gender, and Culture. You never sense lose out for everything should you read some books.

Roderick Donnell:

The book with title The Power of Feelings: Personal Meaning in Psychoanalysis, Gender, and Culture has a
lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This book exist new
knowledge the information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world at this point.
That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This particular book will bring you in
new era of the the positive effect. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read this
anywhere you want.

Wendy Ray:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information quicker to
share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You can
view that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. The book that recommended for your
requirements is The Power of Feelings: Personal Meaning in Psychoanalysis, Gender, and Culture this e-
book consist a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. That book was represented how
can the world has grown up. The words styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand.
The writer made some investigation when he makes this book. That is why this book appropriate all of you.

Kendrick Hardee:

A number of people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the
item when they get a half elements of the book. You can choose the actual book The Power of Feelings:
Personal Meaning in Psychoanalysis, Gender, and Culture to make your personal reading is interesting. Your
own skill of reading skill is developing when you like reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to
see it and mingle the feeling about book and reading through especially. It is to be very first opinion for you
to like to start a book and go through it. Beside that the book The Power of Feelings: Personal Meaning in
Psychoanalysis, Gender, and Culture can to be your new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse with



the information must you're doing of this time.
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